
 

Job in Germany Senior DevOps Engineer Operations (mwd)

Locatie Gelderland, Putten
https://www.advertentiex.nl/x-1583842-z

Senior DevOps Engineer Operations (m/f/d) RIWA - All geospatial information becomes a digital
experience We are the GIS industry leader in Bavaria. With innovative products and comprehensive
services, we offer our customers from the municipal and public sector as well as the free economy added
value every day. Become part of our development team, you have the free choice of location. Decide
whether you would like to work in Memmingen, Augsburg, Amberg, Rosenheim, Würzburg, Landshut or,
after a training period, in a home office. These are your tasks Monitoring and running our software on our
own hardware and in the cloud as a member of the DevOps team. Establishment and continuation of a
CI/CD process Migration of our software operations to container or cloud solutions. Identify optimization
potential and automation of recurring tasks. Introduction and documentation of new systems as well as
applications Troubleshooting and error analysis on various server systems So you know your way around
You have at least 3 years of professional experience in a DevOps team or in the IT field You have a
completed apprenticeship or a degree with a specialization in computer science / IT management or a
comparable qualification in the required field You take responsibility, like to work in agile teams and
ideally already had personnel responsibility You have in-depth knowledge as well as experience in the
use Of current automation technologies and tools from the CI/CD area, such as Git, Jenkins. Of container
orchestration tools such as Docker or Kubernetes. optimally of relational databases (e.g. PostgreSQL,
SQL Server). You have knowledge of Linux You are well-versed in network technology and IT security
You perform your tasks in compliance with data protection regulations and think economically as well as
customer-oriented German language skills (B2/C1) are required for this position What we offer A great
team - GernePerDu - as well as a varied job in the office and home office. Attractive salary, 13 monthly
salaries, capital-forming benefits and a bonus. Family-friendly working time models with flexible working
hours (flexitime) Corporate benefits such as a job bike, flat rate for drinks or employee discounts with over
1,500 suppliers Intensive training in the field of activity and regular training sessions An exciting
environment with varied tasks A safe, centrally located as well as modern workplace with future prospects
Have we aroused your interest? Then send us your informative application documents with details of your
salary expectations and the earliest possible entry date to: RIWA GmbH Michael Fröhler / An der
Neumühle 5 / 87700 Memmingen E-mail: bewerbungriwa.de We connect with the post: DBA, databases,
Linux, PostgreSQL, SQL Server, Continuous Integration, Continuous Delivery, Continuous Deployment,
Git, Shell, Jenkins, Docker, Kubernetes, application development, Computer Science, Information
Technology Specialist.Websiteklik hier voor meer.
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