
 

Bluetooth FM Transmitter  Car Kit  Bluetooth Adapter  Car (8,50 EUR)

Locatie Zuid-Holland, Schiedam
https://www.advertentiex.nl/x-1769576-z

Description
Bluetooth FM Transmitter - Car Kit - Car Charger - Black

Streaming music, hands-free calling and navigating is all possible with this Bluetooth Car FM
Transmitter.< /span>Plug the FM transmitter into the 12V input of the car.UseOften the problem is that
your phone charges very slowly in the car. That is not the case with this Bluetooth car kit! The Fast
Charge charger charges 4x faster than normal chargers. This way you can quickly charge your phone for
short trips.Fast ChargeWith the new model of this Bluetooth FM transmitter, hands-free calling was
possible never been so easy and safe. The rotary knob on top has various functions such as: recording,
rejecting a call and calling back. This way you can fully operate your calls with your eyes on the road.
There is also a clear built-in microphone on the car kit that ensures that you are clearly understood.Ideal
as a car kitThrough With the FM transmitter you can connect your smartphone to a free FM frequency.
You play this on your radio. This way you can listen to your favorite music undisturbed. It makes the
connection from your smartphone to the radio easy and precise, but keep in mind that your radio has the
most influence on your sound quality. In addition to Bluetooth, you can also use a USB stick to play
music.Crystal clear sound? The FM transmitter is Easy to install and use? With many functions which
makes it an ideal car kit? With the charger your phone charges super fast? Supports navigation and voice
control for safe use? With built-in microphone, ideal for hands-free calling? Listen to music without any
noise or disturbance.The transmitter is equipped with a Fast Charge USB port to charge your phone
super quickly and a Car Kit function to always be reachable. Easily connect the transmitter via the
12V/24V port of the car.
Thanks to the FM transmitter you can easily connect your smartphone to the car radio using a free FM
frequency such as 87.5.Tune the frequency of the FM transmitter and the car radio to the same
frequency.I recommend you use the FM frequencies 87.5, 87.6, 107.9 and.
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